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Sports day is an integral part of every student’s life. It is a splendid 
occasion for them to showcase their speed and agility. Pre- Primary 
children celebrated their XVII Annual Sports Day on December 5 & 6, 
2018.The theme this year for the Pre Primary was “Community 
Helpers”. Pre Primary Annual Sports Day commenced with Torch 
bearing ceremony. The Sports Meet was declared open by our 
Principal Ma’am Indu Dubey. The Pre Primary children participated in 
different races where the classmates cheered for them. It was a fun 
packed day for children and parents.
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Pre- primary children celebrated Christmas festival with great 
enthusiasm on December 24, 2018. They came dressed in red and 
green colour clothes. They listened to the story of the birth of Jesus 
Christ and did different activities. They also made cake delight using 
icing cones and relished them. A skit on Christmas was also performed 
by the Sr. Kg. students on this occasion. The children spoke about 
Jesus Christ and shared information on Christmas.
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Nursery children celebrated ‘The Brown Day’ on December 12, 2018 
by flaunting the earthly colours in their attire and highlighting its 
significance. The colour holds a lot of relevance as it represents the 
colour of soil. Shades of brown convey concepts of earth-friendly and 
all natural. The ability to identify colour is considered a milestone in a 
child’s cognitive process. Recognizing the Brown colour and 
identifying the different shades of brown was the motive behind 
celebrating brown colour day. All the teachers and children came 
dressed up in different shades of brown colour. The classrooms were 
beautifully decorated with brown coloured objects. The children were 
showed different coloured objects and asked to name the objects 
which were brown in colour. The brown colour was revised through 
different activities. Through these activities they learnt its significance 
and developed their fine motor skills. The children thoroughly enjoyed 
their practical learning experience.
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A show and tell activity was conducted for Nursery class on 
December 19, 2018 where children brought their favourite wild animal 
and spoke a few lines about it.
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An introduction to ‘Wild Animals’ was done with the Nursery children 
this month. Children came dressed as their favourite wild animal on 
December 21, 2018 and sang a rhyme related to it.
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As a follow-up for the theme Fruits and Vegetables of Winter Season 
Jr.Kg children made fruit salad on December 12, 2018. They relished 
the fruit salad they had made.
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A show and tell activity was conducted for Jr. Kg class on December 
26, 2018 where children brought their favourite polar animal and 
spoke a few lines about it.
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The assembly was conducted by Grade I-E on December 03, 2018. 
The theme of the assembly was ‘Sports’. It started with a skit on 
‘Importance of Exercise and Sports’ in everyday life. It was followed 
by a dance drama showing various sports played in India. The 
children were dressed accordingly and information on various sports 
stars and international sports events was shared. Last but not the 
least, the assembly culminated with a song ‘Aashaiye’ by giving 
message of ‘A dream doesn’t become reality through magic, it takes 
sweat , determination and hard work’. The passion of the children 
was clearly visible in the presentation of the students.
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Grade 2 went for a picnic to Rocksport Academy on 3rd of December. 
The place was full of exciting and adventurous squadron activities like 
zip lining, balance beam, laser beam, alpha cross, commando net, 
gorilla cave, camel ride, DJ floor, to name a few. All these activities 
were specially designed for the kids and urged them to test their 
physical and mental strength. They had a fun packed day along with 
the entire thrill. It was an exhilarating day and will be remembered for 
long.
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Hygiene is one of the basic and significant part of human life. Children 
of Grade II made a small contribution by collecting around 1300 soaps 
for NMS Collection Drive in the month of December. They distributed 
these to Nischay girls and other less fortunate people around the city 
in different slums. The step was taken to spread awareness about 
cleanliness and staying healthy. Amidst these visits, they also learnt 
the importance of sharing and being responsible towards the society. 
Children were eager to help which was evident through their initiative 
to collect the soaps and distribute them with the broad smiles on their 
faces. The visit ended with a short program of singing. They returned 
back feeling contented and happy.
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Grade II F conducted a special assembly on Christmas on December 
24, 2018.The students showcased a skit based on the birth of Jesus. 
They enthusiastically participated and enacted their roles confidently. 
Dance performance on ‘Jingle Bell’ set the festive mood for the day. 
Traditional carols like ‘Joy to the World’ and ‘We wish you a Merry 
Christmas’ sung by our young choir got everybody into the spirit of 
Christmas.
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Grade 2 organised the culmination day for the topic ‘Continents and 
Oceans’. The classes were divided into different continents. The 
students had been preparing for the same and were super excited for 
the presentation. Along with beautiful 3D models, informative charts, 
interactive PowerPoint presentations the children also dresses up and 
pepped up the atmosphere with drum rolling dragon parade, the 
colourful and energetic samba dance and creative boomerang 
decorations. The visitors also relished different cuisines of the world. 
The whole day turned into a carnival and left with a lot of memories to 
cherish.
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Grade III club activities were organized on November 24, 2018. The 
children were enthusiastically involved in the fun filled activities of the 
clubs. All the clubs focused towards the children utilizing their time in 
the most effective and fun manner.  As a follow up, children made a 
scrap book detailing the activities done by them in the club which 
stays with them as a part of their club memory. 
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Students not only learn in their classroom but beyond it, through 
picnic which encourages a feeling of togetherness and a spirit of 
friendship. A class picnic was organized for Class III on December 
20, 2018 and venue chosen was Rock-sport Academy. It was the 
most adventurous and the most excited trip for the children. Children 
enjoyed activities like commandos net, gorilla cave, camel ride, zip 
lining, laser beam and balanced beam. 
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The students of grade III enthusiastically participated in Math Fair on 
26 and 27 December 2018 to showcase their interest in math. The 
students prepared and arranged their presentations, games, puzzles 
and riddles and challenged other students to solve them. The 
teachers also did not miss the chance to be a part of  this fun filled 
Math Fair activities. All the participants were delighted with rewards 
earned by them. They exchanged ideas which added a lot of 
knowledge and information.
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Grade 4 students got an opportunity to visit Birla Planetarium on 
Thursday, December 26, 2018 to add on to their information about 
space. The sparkling stars and planets projected during the show 
created an image of space; making learning about the celestial bodies 
an easy task.

Grade
4

Visit to Birla Planetarium



Children of Grade 5 went to Amer and enthusiastically drew 
monuments in real surroundings as an extension of their Art 
Expression Unit under guidance of art teachers. It was a cherished 
experience for all.
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Google’s CS First Activity was conducted for the students of Grades 
6 to 8 on Saturday December 15. 2018. Students showcased their 
creativity in designing the logo for 'GOOGLE DOODLE' using scratch. 
They also learnt the basics of coding during the process.
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Students of grades 7 and 8 visited City Palace to attend History 
festival on Thursday December 13,2018. A wide range of activities 
were organized for them. Our short documentary BHOPAS (listed in 
top 10 heritage documentaries by INTACH) was screened on all four 
days during the festival. It was a learning experience for the children.
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Primary classes collection drive representatives donated hygiene kits 
and eatables amongst needy in the city and learnt importance of giving 
and gratefulness.

Donation drivePrimary



The primary grades mark a time of tremendous growth in literacy skills, 
making reading activities a crucial part of the school day. Reading 
activities that address all reading skills help young students develop a 
well-rounded approach to literacy. In order to promote the student's 
reading skills while having fun at the same time, a Read Together 
activity was conducted for the students of grade 4 on December 20, 
2018. They read age appropriate story books to improves fluency and 
to expand vocabulary. On completion of the reading session, children 
recommended their books to their classmates inspiring them to read 
more.

Read Together ActivityPrimary







The XVII Annual Sports Meet for senior school was held on December 
01, 2018.The students of grade IX to XII participated with great zeal 
and true sportsman spirit. The meet commenced with the lighting of 
the torch followed by various track events. The students displayed 
their athletic skills with great fervor and enthusiasms. The zealous 
audience gathered in large number constantly applauded the 
participants. It was a successful event where mass participation was 
witnessed displaying healthy participation and discipline.
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Christmas is a time for giving and sharing and there nothing better 
than giving happiness to others and sharing it with the people you 
love. We, the students of IBDP-1 recently held a small Christmas get 
together for the Nischay girls as a part of our Creativity Action Service 
(CAS) project. Service acts as volunteering and it made us caring and 
open minded IB learners. wherein we invited the girls for two hours of 
fun filled activites A classmate made cookies and had the nischay 
girls decorate them with with different color frosting. We made them 
decorate christmas tress and asked them to color pictures of Santas 
and reindeers. But what any christmas get together without music. 
From rocking bollywood to cheesy christmas carols, the girls along 
with all of us danced to these songs with energy and enthusiasm. 
Ending the get together with a pizza party and Santa Claus giving 
gifts to everyone, it was a day that brought a smile on everyone faces.

CAS Project
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